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MASS TIMES 

Sunday – 9am at St Joseph’s 

Sunday – 10am at St Teresa’s 

(including Children’s Liturgy) 

Sunday – 7.15pm at St Teresa’s 

Monday - 10am at St Joseph’s 

Tuesday – 10am at St Teresa’s 

Wednesday – 10am at St Joseph’s 

Thursday – 10am at St Teresa’s 

Friday –10am at St Joseph’s 

Saturday – 10am at St Teresa’s 

(including Exposition & Rosary) 

Saturday – 6pm at St Joseph’s 

CONFESSION 

Saturday 10.30 – 11am at  

St Teresa’s 

Saturday 5.30 – 5.50pm at  

St Joseph’s 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

FIRST HOLY COMMUNION 
 
This weekend children in the Parish made their First Holy Communion. 

Thank you most sincerely to our parents, catechists, teachers, pupils, 
parishioners, and to all who played some part in celebrating the gift of our young 
children who received their First Holy Communion.  

Please keep them in your prayers as they continue their journey of faith, hope 
and love, as members of the body of Christ. 

 
THE CHURCHES BIRTHDAY – PENTECOST  
 
Last Sunday, Whit Sunday, was a joyous occasion for all. Almost twenty years 
ago, the local churches decided to celebrate the feast of Pentecost together in 
prayer, the breaking of bread and fellowship. 

The love and fellowship which has developed among the churches through the 
years, was in evidence at St. Teresa’s School where scripture and prayers 
reminded us of the birth of the church and hymns, lead powerfully by Cadishead 
Band, stirred our hearts and memories. The dramatic enactment of the first 
Pentecost gathering was especially poignant! 

This was followed by the breaking of bread together, in true buffet style, where 
young and not so young mingled in friendship. 
Thanks be to God for the occasion and thanks to all who helped, in any way, to 
make this possible. 
HAPPY BIRTHDAY! 

 

BETHLEHEM ART 
 
We welcome representatives of the Palestinian Christian Community at all our 
Masses on the weekend of 6/7th July. Their mission is to provide income for the 
few Christian families living in Bethlehem.  

There are few pilgrims and visitors to the Holy Land and so families have no 
means of selling their work. The result is that many families are facing great 
poverty and distress, as this is for many their main livelihood. We will have the 
opportunity of buying some of their goods after each Mass.  

The items are produced by local craftsmen and women and are individually hand 
carved from the wood of the olive tree that are common throughout the Holy 
Land. Every purchase of these carvings will help to support the many Christian 
families that still in current times live under constant deprivation and conflict.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

“I plead with you – never ever give up hope, never doubt, 

never tire, and never become discouraged.  Do not be afraid” 

– St John Paul II 
Hymn Numbers for the Acclamations:   

The Sanctus – 433  

The Mystery of Faith - 434 

 



THANK YOU 

We are so grateful for your generosity every week when donating to the 

Offertory Collection.  The combined total of both churches last week was 

£824.85.  Thank you for your continued support towards our Parish.  

 

 

 

 

Contact - Father Tony Clarke 
Tel: 0161 465 1409 

Contact Us 

St, Teresa of Avila RC Church 

Astley Road 

Irlam 

M44 6AB 

Facebook: St Teresa of Avila and St 

Joseph the Worker RC Parish Irlam 

AVILA CENTRE 

Monday Club 12 noon 

(on Monday of course!)                

Faith Sharing on Wednesday 

7.00pm  

Healthy Hearts and Hips on 

Friday at 10am 

 

OUR CHILDREN 

Say this prayer together when the 

children return from their Liturgy 

Dear Lord, 

Watch over these little 

ones in our parish family 

and help us to lead them 

to you. 

Amen 

 

 
BONUS BALL WINNERS 

FOR 8th JUNE… 

E Hunt 

D Hanley 

S Egan 

Ball Number 43 

 

 

 

 

INTENTIONS FOR THIS WEEK 

Lately Dead – Luke Dumbell, Benny Mone and Brian Richardson 

Anniversaries – Francis Joseph Brady (8th June), Peter Uy (12th June),      

Agnes Ethenngton (13th June), Roy Tomlinson – (14th June), Mark Murphy 

(17th June) and Betty Townsend (18th June) 

Birthday Intentions – William (Bill) Williams (14th June) 

Sick – Lynda Brannigan 

In Thanksgiving – Peter Mam and Maria Nguyet 

 

WELCOME TO OUR PARISH 

Zara-Leigh McCartney, daughter of Lauren and Jordan, who was Baptised last 

week. 

 

MASSES THIS WEEK 

On Thursday 20th June there will be a Requiem Mass at St Teresa’s church at 

11am, for Bridget Theresa Hughes.  Please keep Bridget, her family and 

friends in your prayers at this sad time. 

 

On Saturday 22nd June the second group of children will make their First Holy 

Communion.  The celebration Mass will take place at 11am in St Teresa’s 

Church.  Please note, there will be no 10am service on Saturday. 

 

 

 

SOMETHING FOR THE KIDS…Find all the words 

 

 

 


